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3. MBA Concentration Proposal; assigned to subcommittee #2 (James Lenze, Nashat Zuraikat, 

Dawn Woodland, Claire Dandeneau, Mark Staszkiewicz) – 10/3/06; subcommittee sent their 
report electronically to the committee; no discussion – 10/17/06; no discussion – 
10/31/06;lengthy discussion, LaPorte to look closely at and bring a summary back to the 
committee to discuss further at the next meeting – 11/14/06; LaPorte will meet with the 
proposers regarding what needs to be done for this to move  forward for approval – 11/21/06; 
LaPorte has a meeting set for Friday, December 1, 2006 with Prashanth regarding proposal – 
11/28/06; no discussion – 1/23/07; no discussion – 2/6/07 

 
4. New Course: EDSP 523 Educational Programming for Gifted Learners; assigned to 

subcommittee #2 (James Lenze, Nashat Zuraikat, Dawn Woodland, Claire Dandeneau, Mark 
Staszkiewicz, Matt Baumer) – 8/29/06; no discussion – 9/5/06; subcommittee presented their 
report with several suggestions; memo will be sent to proposer – 9/19/06; another memo will 
be sent – 9/26/06; no discussion – 10/3/06; no discussion – 10/17/06; nothing back from 
proposer; no discussion – 10/31/06; no discussion – 11/14/06; no discussion – 11/21/06; memo 
will be sent to proposer stating they may turn in the changes they have made and UWGCC will 
continue with the approval process, then it can be forwarded to UWUCC for approval – 
11/28/06; the proposer sent the committee the change on this (12/19/06); this course number 
has changed to 523 because the department has listed this as dual level, EDSP 423/523; the 
department did not have anything from the library so Dr. LaPorte sent them an email 
suggesting the way to go about getting the information needed from the library – 1/23/07; 
waiting information from the library; no discussion – 2/6/07 

 
5. Graduate Distance Education Review Form: EDSP 523 Educational Programming for Gifted 

Learners; assigned to subcommittee #2 (James Lenze, Nashat Zuraikat, Dawn Woodland, 
Claire Dandeneau, Mark Staszkiewicz, Matt Baumer) – 8/29/06; no discussion – 9/5/06; 
subcommittee presented their report; upon completion of the new course EDSP 623 this 
distance education course will fall in line – 9/19/06; no discussion – 9/26/06; no discussion – 
10/3/06; no discussion – 10/17/06; nothing back from proposer; no discussion – 10/31/06; no 
discussion – 11/14/06; no discussion – 11/21/06; memo will be sent to proposer stating they 
may turn in the changes they have made and UWGCC will continue with the approval process, 
then it can be forwarded to UWUCC for approval – 11/28/06; nothing came from the proposer 
concerning this course; no discussion – 1/23/07; no discussion – 2/6/07 

 
6. Course Deletion for GEOG 571 Aerospace workshop; this was not assigned to a subcommittee 

– 11/14/06; after some discussion it was decided that a memo will be sent to the proposer to ask 
them to submit a minor program revision and that the will ask that the agenda item for Senate 
be pulled – 11/21/06; memo was sent to proposer about submitting a minor program revision  – 
11/28/06; waiting for something from proposer; no discussion – 1/23/07; no discussion – 2/6/07 

 
7. HPED 641 Administration of Aquatic Programs (Graduate Distance Education Review Form); 

assigned to subcommittee #1(James Myers, David Piper, Scott Moore, Karen Brown, Wenfan 
Yan) – 2/6/07 

 
8. HPED 642 Design and Operation of Aquatic Facilities (Graduate Distance Education Review 

Form); assigned to subcommittee #1(James Myers, David Piper, Scott Moore, Karen Brown, 
Wenfan Yan) – 2/6/07 
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